From:

Sent: Friday, July 22, 2011 5:29 PM
To: Sean Lachance
Subject: Re: Purcharse Order #65674 pickup receipt

thanks sean. | see the new invoice, but not the =redit card authorization form..

On Jul 22, 2011, at 1:25 =M, Sean Lachance wrote:

You =re fine with the 90 square feet.

I've =ttached a revised invoice and credit card authorization form for you to =end back.
Thanks again,

Sean =aChance
From:

Sent: !rl!av, ]LIL' !!, !!!l l!!! =!

To: Sean =achance
Subject: Re: Purcharse Order #65674 =ickup receipt

Thank you Sean, | will =ait for the new Credit card authorization =orm.
Please let me know when =ou hear from Global as to whether 90 square feet of suede is the =orrect amount

needed as I'd like to get everything ordered today before =he weekend.
Thanks for =our help!

On Jul 21, =011, at 5:59 PM, Sean Lachance wrote:

| just emailed the factory asking =hem,

thanks

On Jul 21, =011, at 5:07 PM, Sean Lachance =rote:
When sending the suede to Global =lease include this sheet of =aper.

Sean =aChance
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From: Monica =ristizabal

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 =:57 PM

To: Sean =achance

Subject: Purcharse Order 865674 =ickup =eceipt

Monica Aristizabal
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