From:

Sent: Friday, July 22, 2011 5:47 PM

To: Sean Lachance

Subject: Re: Purcharse Order #65674 pickup receipt
thank you.

and just confirming the =hipping address for the leather is:
Global Industries =outh

<=jv=0n Jul 22, 2011, at 1:39 PM, Sean Lachance wrote:

Sean =aChance

From

sent: Friday, July 22, 2011 1:29 =M

To: 5ean =achance

Subject: Re: Purcharse Order #65674 =ickup receipt

thanks sean. | see the =ew invoice, but not the credit card authorization =orm..
On Jul 22, 2011, at 1:25 =M, Sean Lachance wrote:

Sara

The PO is in the system with Global and the are =waiting the shipment of Leather. Please make sure the RGA # is
on that =hipment.

I've attached a revised invoice =nd credit card authorization form for you to send =ack.

Sean =aChance

Sent: Friday, July 22, 2011 10:58 =M
To: Sean =achance
Subject: Re: Purcharse Order #65674 =ickup receipt

Thank you =ean, | will wait for the new Credit card authorization =orm.
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Please let me =now when you hear from Global as to whether 90 square feet of suede is =he correct amount
needed as |I'd like to get everything ordered today =efore the weekend.
Thanks for your =elp!

OnJul 21, 2011, at 5:59 PM, Sean Lachance =rote:

The chair prices out at $590 =ow

I will revise the order and send you a new invoice. = have not run the credit card authorization so | will send you
another =orm to fill out for the new =alance.

thanks
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On Jul 21, 2011, at 5:07 PM, Sean Lachance =rote:

When sending the suede to Global =lease include this sheet of =aper.
Sean =aChance

=iy

Monica Aristizabal

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 =:57 PM

To: Sean =achance

Subject: Purcharse Order #65674 =ickup =eceipt
Pickup Receipt for PO # 65674 =ttached

=UP.pdf =65674.pdf>

<0OFW Crdit card =uthorization.pdf=>
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