From:

Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2011 1:02 PM
To: Bella Klein
Subject: Re: JE AMex

Yes.. =hat is valid
it's our hotel in rome

On Aug 10, 2011, =t 5:44 PM, Bella Klein wrote:

Grand Hotel Parco Deroma -15 1T A VALID CHARGE ON AUGUST =7
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EFTA_R1_01238751
EFTA02323708



