
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Friday, January 19, 2018 2:07 AM 
To: Kiko Zhou 
Cc: Richard Kahn; Bella Klein; Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: Outdoor furniture order CK20180118 

Dear Kiko, 

Could you =lease provide us the payment details for the order? 
Mrs. =aphne Wallace, who is copied on this email, will coordinate with you in =egards to the shipping. 

Thank you very =uch! 

Karyna 

On =an 18, 2018, at 9:02 PM, Karyna Shuliak > wrote: 

Thank you Kiko! 

I will resend the email =ow. 

Thanks, 

Karyna 

On Jan =8, 2018, at 9:00 PM, Kiko Zhou wrote: 

dear Karyna 
this is my email 

thanks & have good day. 
Kiko (project Manager) 
Foshan Shunde Jixinge =urniture Co.,Ltd 
Foshan Momoda furnishing Co.,Ltd 
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