
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Thursday, September 14, 2017 7:20 PM 
To: Edith Que 
Subject: Re: Drapes for apt 11P apt at 301 E 66th 

Hi Edith, 

Thank you for letting me know. What is the earliest available installation a=pointment at the moment? 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

> On Sep 14, 2017, at 2:27 PM, Edith Qu > wrote: 

> Hi Karyna, 

> The draperies were dropped off at our 84th St. location. Please let me kno= what time is convenient so I can check the 
installer's schedule. 

> Regards, 

> Edith Que 
> Design Consultant 
> Janovic 

> M-F 18am -5pm 

> From: Karyna Shulia 
> Sent: Thursday, September 7, 2017 4:56 PM 
> To: Edith Que 
> Subject: Re: Drapes for apt 11P apt at 301 E 66th 

> Great, thank you very much Edith. Appreciate it! 

» On Sep 7, 2017, at 4:16 PM, Edith Que > wrote: 

» Hi Karyna, 

» I spoke with the workroom contact person and she'll try to deliver them t= the store next week. As soon as I receive 
them, I'll contact you so we can=set-up an appointment for installation. 

» Regards, 
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» Edith Que 
» Design Consultant 

» M-F l8am -5pm 

» From: Karyna Shulia 
» Sent: Thursday, September 7, 2017 3:15 PM 
» To: Edith Que 
» Subject: Fwd: Drapes for apt 11P apt at 301 E 66th 

» Begin forwarded message: 
>> 
» From: Ebby Saghian 

» Date: June 20 2017 at 6:15:32 PM EDT 
» To: Bella KI 
» Cc: Karyna < 
» Richard=Kahn 

» Subject: RE: Drapes for apt 11P apt at 301 E 66th 

» Thank you all, 
» I will proceed with the order and will send you the copy. 

» Kind regards, 

>> 

» Off on Fridays 

» From: Bella Klein 
» Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 4:49 PM 
» To: Ebby Saghian 
» Cc: Karyna; Richard Kahn 
» Subject: Drapes for apt 11P apt at 301 E 66th 

» Dear Ebby, 
» Please charge $5040.27 to Amex ending on 2008. 
> > 

» Thank you, 
» Bella 

» I.co=> 

> > 

> > 

» Hi Karyna, 

2 

EFTA_R1_01240382 

EFTA02324397



» FABRIC = 59.75 - 25% = 44.81 X 51 = 2285.31 FREIGHT = 76.50 LABOR TO 
» MAKE THE DRAPES = 1246.10 TRACK = 399.50 FREIGHT = 40.00 INSTALLATION 
» = 582.00 TOTAL = 4629.41 + TAX = 5040.27 

» All extra discounts applied as the previous job. 

» Kind regards, 

» Ebb Sa hian 

» Off on Fridays 
>> 
» From: Karyna Shuliak 

» Sent: I nursday, June 15, B:ul PM
» To: Ebby Saghian 
» Subject: Re: ESTIMATE 

» Hi Ebby, 
» Could you please kindly send an invoice with the price breakdown, so that=l could forward it to Mr. Kahn. 
» Thank you very much! 
» Karyna 
>> 

» Hi Karyna, 

» The estimate is just below. I sent it to you on 6/8 You are replying 
» to the estimate that I sent. 
» Please let me know. the total as indicated is 5040.27 Kind regards, 

» ' 

» on nays 
>> 

» Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2017 2:56 PM 
» To: Ebby Saghian 
» Subject: Re: ESTIMATE 

» Hi Ebby, 

» This is Karyna. I haven't heard back from you regarding the estimate fo= the 301 E 66th St, apt.11P project. 
» Please advice. 
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» Thank you, 

» Karyna 
>> 

wrote: 

» Hi Karyna, 
» I just left you a message. 
» I checked the fabric and it is available as of now. it is a little more t=an the other fabric. 
» I discounted all just like your privious and the total of this job 
» will b= 5040.27 Please let me know. 

» Kind regards, 

» Ebby Saghian 
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