
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2017 6:58 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Sonam work hours 

Ok, I will let her know. 
Thank you! 

On Jul 20, 2017, at 2:56 PM, Bella Klein &l=  > wrote:<=r> 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel:=span class="Apple-tab-span" style="white-space: pre;" 

On J=l 20 2017 at 2:55 PM, Karyna Shuliak < 
<mailto > wrote: 

Thank you Bella! 
She will come today. What would be the best time? 
On Jul 20, 2017, at 2:33 PM, Bella Klein <f • wrote: 

I can pay her today or tomorrow cash for 25 1/2 hours tota= of $510. Please let me know if I 
should add her to visitors list 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel:=span class= Apple-tab-span" style="white-space: pre;"> 

On Jul 20, 2017, at 2:14 PM, Karyna Shuliak 

cmailtc » wrote:<Mv> 

Hi Bella, 
Sonam ha= finished work at 301 for this week. We don't have anything else for her 

to=do until the next week. Please let me know when she can collect her payment=and I will tell her. 
Her work hours are as follows: 

EFTA_R1_01240978 
EFTA02324609



Mon 9am - 6pm 
<=iv style="margin: Opx; line-height: normal; font-family: '.SF UI Text'; c=lor: rgb(69, 69, 

69);" class="">Tue 9am - 6pm 
Wed 9am - 4:30pm 
She also was at 71st today for 45min to have interview with Mr. E=stein. But I suppose 

that does not count? 

Thank you! 
Karyna 

<=r class=""> 
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