From: Karyna Shuliak _

Sent: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 4:56 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: Epstein invoice showing deposit

They are coming to measure the area tomorrow. | will send you =he quote when it is ready.
Thank you again!

On Sep 26, 2017, at 12:40 PM, Karyna Shulial-c_

Thank you Rich, | will.

On =ep 26, 2017, at 10:32 AM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

attached is previous invoice for =arpet
please have vendor prepare quote that i can review =f you want to handle this project
thank =ou

Richard Kahn

HBREK =ssociates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th =loor
MNew York, NY 10022

tel

fa
cel

Begin forwarded message:
Subject: Fwd: Epstein invoice showing deposit

Date: June &, 2014 at 4:02:3% PM EDT

thank =ou

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
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New York, NY 10022
tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded =essage:

Subject: Epstein =nvoice showing deposit

Date: June &, 2014 at 3:53:05 PM =DT

>

Roger lones
Paul's Abbey Carpet & Floor
Sales =xecutive

<f=jy>

<epstein showing =eposit, pdf>
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