From: Karyna Shuliak W
Sent: Tuesday, August 9, 2016 5:1

To: bellaklein

Subject: Re: Lotus Invoice# 19666
Hi Bella,

Yes, lo=ks correct.

Thank you.

On Aug 9, 2016, at 7:57 AM, | - < wrote:

Hi Karyna,
Please confirm that t=e attached invoice is correct

=br class=""=

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/span>dispatcher @ LotusRide.com <mailto:dispatcher@lotusride.com>
Subject: Lotus Invoiced 19666

<=span>
=ate: August 8, 2016 at 4:02:01 PM EDT

<f=iv>
<|nvoice # 19666.pdf=
=/div>

B=t;Voucher (inv # 19666).pdf>
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