From: caryna shuio [ NN

Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2017 3:37 AM

To: Richard Kahn

Cc: Merwin

Subject: Re: PROPOSAL FOR PARTS NEEDED FOR CHICAGO IRONER

| told Mr. Epstein about the additional estimated labor cost =f 51100. He said to still go ahead and fix it.

On =pr 19, 2017, at 6:51 PM, Karyna Shuliak </{| G ot

Yes, this is much higher then the initial proposal of =565.89, that Mr. Epstein has approved.
Rich, would =ou like me to speak to him about the new total cost? Or have you =lready mentioned to him?
Thanks.

wrote:

so total projected cost is 660+220+220 or =,1007?
seems high??

Richard =ahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Apr 19, 2017, at 3:54 PM, Merwin Dela cruz_rute:

Hi Rich,

It should take about 3 hours to =nstall.

Rate is 2 men job @ 330 dollars per person =or the 1st hour and 110 dollars for every additional
hour per =an.

Thanks

On Apr 18, 2017, at 10:05 AM, Richard Kahn _mte:

1
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wrote:

in addition =ist was only parts
what is labor rate and estimated =ours to perform work?
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, =Y 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Apr 14, 2017, at 11:17 AM, Merwin Dela cruz _

Karyna,
Here is the proposal to fix the presser. Please =dvise.

Thanks

Begin forwarded =essage:

From: Richard Barnett <

Subject: Fw: PROPOSAL FOR PARTS NEEDED FOR CHICAGO IRONER

Date: April 5, 2017 at 2:47:33 PM EDT

Merwin =nbsp;this came to my email for 71st street,

From: Erik Kohl
Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2017 2:15 =M
To:
Ce: Andrew Daly
Subject: PROPOSAL FOR PARTS NEEDED =0OR CHICAGO IRONER

Good =orning,
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Here attached is your proposal for parts needed for your =hicago ironer, as per
our service tech Russell W.

Please=let us know how you wish to proceed so we can have you up and
running =gain.

Thanks !

Erik Kohl

<MNES LLC.docx>
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