From: I

Sent: Monday, August 1, 2011 6:44 PM
To: Richard Barmett
Subject: Re: Proposal: RBHVAC

Ok no problem. Je will still be out of t=wn then. Thanks

On Aug 1, 2011, at 8:37 PM, Richard Earnett_wmte:

Hi Sara the best i could do is Monday August 8th or maybe Tuesday August 9th= He is still working out east in LI
.Rich

From:
mmbject: Re: Proposal: RBHVAC<br=Date: Mon, 1 A=g

2011 14:26:27 -0400<br>To: <a href==>
Je approved Dominic and Adam!! Yea
Begin forwarded message:<=r>

From: jeffr=y epstein < <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> jeevacation@gmail.com
<mailto:je=vacation@gmail.com> >

pate-uly 29, 2011 23827 o eore-oo o
!u!ject: !E: !mpusal: !!!!!!

Yes

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone

wrote:

Dominic and Adam should be available next week to install the large ter=ace photo and
they would charge 52400 to install. They installed it the las= 2 times. Should we schedule them to install next week?
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Be=in forwarded message:

From: Richa=d Barnett [ N RREEEE

Date: July 14, 2011 11:14:31 AM EDT

To: jeffrey Epstein <sarahk525@me.c=m _

Subject:&n=sp;FW: Proposal: RBHVAC

Mr. Epstein attached is a proposal to install the mural on t=e &6th floor terrace
for 52,850.00 from Interboro Sign co. | could not get&n=sp;Dominik & Adam to do the installation please approve and |
can g=t mural installed on Monday 7/18/11 Richard

= Date: Thu, 14 Jul 2011 09:31:28 -0400

=

= Dear Mr. Barnett, <=r>>

> Attach=d you will find the proposal you requested for 9 East 71st Street.
= |= you have any questions or concerns, please let me know.

>

= Thank you,

=

> Kimberly Klockner

<RBHWAC - 9 East 71st Street 7-14-11.doc>
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