
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2011 7:08 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: reimbursment 

Yes ma'am 

On Aug 16, 2011, at 3:05 PM, Bella Klei wrote: 

correct? 
> On Aug 16, 2011, at 2:22 PM, Sarah K wrote: 

» Hi Bella, 
» Please see below 2 screen shots from my personal Amex showing charges 
» for=travel which I booked on my personal card. There are 3 service charges from=AmEx for 3 tickets I booked from 
Dubai to Paris. (one of these flights I ca=celled and should be getting a credit for the ticket amount, but will still=have to 
pay the service charge) and one ticket from air france for myself f=om dubai to paris($3112.80) and one ticket on air 
france for Je from dubai t= paris.($9,022.80) can you please wire $12,252.60 to my Citibank account so I can pay my 
cre=it card online. Thank you. 

» <Screen Shot 2011-0846 at 2.16.36 PM.png> 

» <Screen Shot 2011-08-16 at 2.15.25 PM.png> 
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