
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Karyna Shuliak 
Wednesday, August 26, 2015 8:51 PM 

Re: We Need to Book St. Barths Hotel today 

I think this should be ok, I also forwarded to JE, will let you know if he a=vice otherwise 

> On Aug 26, 2015, at 4:47 PM, wrote: 

> The hotel in St. Barth's is requesting the 30% non refundable deposit be=paid today...what do you think? I just opened 
the PDF the Hotel Manapany &=Spa sent you and it states : Thank you for your reservation, we are delight=d you will be 
joining us. Etc...i think this may be enough for your appoin=ment without having to pay? 
> <Karyna Voucher.pdf> 
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