From: I

Sent: Saturday, September 17, 2011 4:09 AM
To: francis derby
Subject: Re:

sounds like a plan!

You can ask as many questions as you like.. | don't mind at all We do have a petty cash system in place with our
accountant, not a problem. You just need to give her your receipts, or | guess in the case of farmers market, just write
down what it was for, etc..

I will be in touch about Wed. as soon as | know something concrete!

On Sep 16, 2011, at 10:04 PM, francis derby wrote:

Hi Sarah,
I'm going to have some random questions for you in the coming days, | hope i don't drive you nuts.

When purchasing product is there a petty cash system in place? | like to go to the farmers market as much as
possible and thats a cash only situation.

| would say that for the next week we will only need the blender. If the week works out and everyone is happy
with my food, then | would like to go ahead and get a couple knives to have in the kitchen and the rice cooker. The
kitchen seems pretty well stocked with the exception of those few items. There may be a couple things we will need
from time to time, but to get started what is there now seems more than sufficient. Does that sound like a good plan?

This is the blender they have it at Williams Sonoma, i believe its out of stock at JB Prince,

http://www.williams-sonoma.com/products/vitamix-blender-professional-

200/ ?pkey=e%7Cvitamix%e2Bprofessional%2Bseries%%2B200%2Bblendert%7C1%7Cbest¥%7C0%7C1%7C24% 7 C%7C1E&cm_s
rc=PRODUCTSEARCH| | NoFacet-_-NoFacet-_-MoMerchRules-_-

Thanks for showing me around today, looking forward to cooking on weds. Please contact me when you have
any details about next week.

Francis

On i, Sep 16,2011 at 12:26 P N, > ot

Hi Fran,
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It was a pleasure meeting you yesterday. Just checking if you want to stop by the house today to have a
look at the kitchens. Whatever time works for you is good, just let me know and | will make sure there is someone there

to let you in and show you. Thanks! Sarah. My cell is
The address is
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