From: Karyna shuliak <[ -

Sent: Friday, April 29, 2016 &:50 PM
To: Bella Klein

Cc: ]

Subject: Re: ATAT bill issue

Yes, the billing address should be _. does not have her card with her at the moment,

so maybe try using =ine. The details that | gave you and my name Karyna Shuliak. It is a =oint account anyway..
Thanks Bella!

> 0n Apr 29, 2016, at 2:46 PM, bellaklein <[ GGG ote:

>

= Please confirm zip 10065
= Thank you,

> Bella

-1

=1
= Tel:

>

>
>>On Apr 29, 2016, at 2:43 PM, Karyna Shuliak _:- wrote:
>

== This one is on my name: Karyna Shuliak. The one in the system | =elieve is Jenn’s. . can you please email your card
details =o Bella?

>>
>>> On Apr 29, 2016, at 2:42 PM, bellaklein <[ - v ote:

>33

»»>what is name on the visa?

=== Thank you,

==> Bella

>>>

2o

»>>> Tel:

e

e

»>>>> 0n Apr 29, 2016, at 2:31 PM, Karyna Shuliak—:- wrote:
>3>>

==>> Hi Bella,

>>>> The credit card # is _

=>»>> Exp. 01/17.

»>>>> Code:432

=>>>> et me know if you need more information..

>=>> Thanks a lot!

=22 Karyna.

e e

>>>>> On Apr 29, 2016, at 1:52 PM, bellaklein <[ - - cte:
B2

»>»>>> Please email credit card info and i will renew on file
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2an>
»>>>> Thank you,

>»>5> Bella

SEEm>

2EEn>

=nmnns Tel:

BB

2RI

»»>»>> 0n Apr 29, 2016, at 1:05 PM, Karyna Shuliak_:- wrote:
e e e e

>335 Hi Bella,

»=>=>> This is the login info that | have:

EEED

>=>>>> att login

=am33> Useri

BBSB33 PASS:

e B e

}}}}}}._, is this right?

>>>>>> Thank youl

>5>>>>> On Apr 29, 2016, at 12:29 PM, bellaklein <[ GG =rote:

P 2 e e e e

e Harvnal

5> Please email ATT account login info or |atest bill Thank you,
»3>3333> Bella

P
PEREEER

>35> Tel:

PEEEEDD

P

>>>>>>>> On Apr 28, 2016, at 12:05 PM, Karyna Shuliak ||| GG - rote:

b e e e e e e

»>>>>>>>> Hi Bella,

55>2555> Would you be able to help me and . with the following issue =lease:

>>>>>>>>we have a joint AT&T account that was set up for auto-pay with =ur Deutsche bank account. However this
months the payment failed, just =poke with AT&T agent, they say it is a card issue, that the payment was =eclined. Could
you please check for us what is the issue with the card? = don't have access info in order to check it..

===n255> Thanks a lot,

==xxxz2> Karyna.

BEEEE

e

]
>
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