From: I

Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2016 4:56 PM
To: Paulette Gardener
Subject: Re: Pillow Order

Great! Thank you!

On =ul 6, 2016, at 12:48 PM, Paulette Gardener _wmte:

The UPS tracking number =s 1Z 197 81603 1020 7965

Paulette

Paulette =ardener - Bookkeeper
Interiors By Royale
964 =rd Avenue

NYC =
Tel no

www.interiorsbyroyale.com

Sent: Wednesday, July 06, 2016 =2:41 PM
To: Paulette Gardener
Subject: Re: Pillow Order

Thanks Paulette! Please let me know the =racking info once the pillows are shipped to Palm Beach.
Thanks

On Jul 6, 2016, at 12:28 PM, Paulette :ardene_

Bella provided me with = new credit card . The charge went through so attached is a copy of the =aid
invoice
and charge receipt.

The pillows will ship out later on =oday

Regards
Paulette
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Paulette Gardener - =ookkeeper
Interiors =y Royale

964 3rd =venue

NYC 1

www.interiorsbyroyale.com

From:

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2016 4:01 =M
To: Paulette Gardener

Subject: Re: Pillow Order

Hi Paulette,
Please charge the same credit card for =he remaining balance and send me the receipt. Yes, the pillows

will =eed to be sent to Palm Beach, so please add your shipping fee of =75.

=300.00

=ccountant.

On Jul 5, 2016, at 3:55 PM, Paulette Gardene_:rote:

Attached is a copy of =he invoice which shows the 50% deposit paid so far on this order of

Thank you
Paulette

Paulette Gardener - Bookkeeper

Interiors By =oyale

964 =rd Avenue

MNYC 10

Tel no.

www.interiorsbyroyale.com <http://www.interiorsbyroyale.com/>

From:

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2016 3:11 =M
To: Paulette Gardener

Subject: Re: Pillow Order

Hello Paulette,
Please send me a receipt =f what was paid up to this point, so | can review it with the
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<mailto

see =ttached invoice.

=efore shipment

Hard copies are in the =ail.

wrote:

On Jul 5, 2016, at 11:28 AM, Paulette Gardener =I_

Good morning

Your pillow order is =eady. There is a balance due before they are released of $300.00,
If you want us to ship =he pillows to Florida, that will be an additional $75.00, payable

Thank you
Paulette

Paulette Gardener - Bookkeeper
Interiors By =oyale

964 =rd Avenue

NYC 10
Tel no.
www.interiorsbyroyale.com <http://www.interiorsbyroyale.com/>

From: Paulette Gardener [mailm_

Sent: Thursday, June 23, 2016 =1:52 AM
To
Subject: FW: Pillow Order

Paulette Gardener - Bookkeeper
Interiors By =oyale

964 =rd Avenue

NYC 10155
Tel no.
www.interiorsbyroyale.com <http://www.interiorsbyroyale.com/>

From: Paulette Gardener (mailto JERNNGTGTTITIGGGGE
Sent: Wednesday, June 22, 2016 =:13 PM
TD:_

Subject: FW: Pillow Order

From: Paulette Gardener [mailm_

Segk =

T
C
Subject: Pillow Order

Good afternoon

Please see attached invoice showing deposit =pplied and also copy of charge receipt.
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Lena is processing your order

Thank you
Paulette

Paulette Gardener - =ookkeeper
Interiors By Royale

964 3rd =venue

NYC =0155

www.interiorsbyroyale.com <http://www.interiorsbyroyale.com/>

<C7828 pdf-

<C7828.pdf>

<20160706112718.pdf>

=/blockquote>
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