From: -

Sent: Monday, September 26, 2011 5:25 PM
To: Ombrellificio Adria Mare (email)
Subject: Re: Modelle Rimini beach chairs

Thank you for the information. Do you know if it would be less expensive =or shipping costs if they were to be sent to: ?

Tropical Shipping

usA

If it is the same shipping cost either way, | will proceed to send them =o 5t.Thomas, but thought | would ask. What is the

best way to make =ayment to you? Credit card of wire transfer?
Thank you!

On Sep 22, 2011, at 3:32 AM, Ombrellificio Adria Mare (email) wrote:

> On Wed, 21 Sep 2011 12:17:16 -0400, [ wrote
=> Ok Thank you!! | just wanted to make sure you had received my first

»=> == email regarding the order as | had no reply. | will wait for your response. Thank you for your help.

a2
>>0n Sep 21, 2011, at 12:04 PM, "Ombrellificio Adria Mare (email)"
o

>>> On Wed, 21 Sep 2011 10:21:46 -0400, [ wrote

>>>> Hello again. Is it possible to finalize this order for 3 of your

= "Article 11" wooden sun beds with sun canopy in walnut wood with =abric 55017
= My client wants to only order 3 for the time being so he can see the

> =roduct first, then we will place a larger order once he has seen the

= chairs =n person. | would very much appreciate it if you could help me

> in =ompleting this order by sending me the prices of the chairs and

= shipping costs =o 5t.Thomas, USVI{see address below). Also, what is the best way to make => payment? Credit card,

wire transfer, etc?

>»>> Thank you for your help
.-

=

>=>> Begin forwarded message:

e e

S5

=>>>> Subject: Re: Modello Rimini beach chairs
33>

=>>>> Date: September 16, 2011 10:07:41 AM EDT
SEEn

=2»>> To: Ombrellificio Adria Mare (email)
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-
e
=>>>> Great! Thank you! | would like to order 3 of your Article 11,
=»>>> =poden

> sun beds with sun canopy in walnut, with fabric color 5501,
>»>>> | would like them shipped to:

i e e
2R
e e e ]
e
e e

e
B

>=>>> Can you please give me the price for this and the lead time and
>>>>> —pgt

> way for payment? Thank you!

- -

220>

»>>>>0n Sep 13, 2011, at 4:56 AM, Ombrellificio Adria Mare (email) =rote:
BBBD

>>>>>> On Mon, 12 Sep 2011 13:41:36 -0400, [ wrote

PEEEEm

SEBEEm

»>»>>>> Thank you for your response. Do you offer these chairs with a
=»3>>> =goden

S

>>»>>>> frame instead of aluminum? Also, | am unable to open your
»>>>>>> =atalog

e

=>>>>> from your website, Can you please send me the available colors
2a»me =01

S

>>>>>> this chair? And do you by chance have a showroom anywhere in the
22pe»> =22>222> USA? Thank you,

e

el e e

e e

>>>>>> 0n Sep 6, 2011, at 4:46 AM, Ombrellificio Adria Mare (email) =rote:
e e e e e 2

e e e e e

bt e e ]

>>>>>>> On Tue, 23 Aug 2011 10:38:34 -0400, [l wrote

P

»5>>>55> Hello. | am interested in buying some of your Modello Rimini
>3»3333> =gach

B e e B

>>»»>>>> chairs. Can you please let me know the price, options for
»23>>>>> =olors and
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EE S S S
>>>»>>>> if you ship to the USA? Many thanks. - -
BHHBHHHD =_

RS S

E S S

A

=>>>>>> Dear Ms -

e e

e e e e O

e e e e e e e

=»>>>>> Thank you for inquiry

SEHEHHH>

RS

R 5

>»>>>>> The price for our Modello Rimini is

>=>>5>> =UTF-87][WINDOWS-1252 7] [WINDOWS-

> 12527]4,- 220,00 + shipping

e e

>>>>> cost

e e

e e e e e e e

= e

e e e )

BEBBHBHD

=>>>>>> Best Regards

BEBEBRHD

»=»=233 Ombrellificio Adriamare snc

SBBHHDD

e

e
e e e e e

e

»>»>> Dear Ms _

=

>=>>>> |n attached file our catalogue, you can find the colors chart in
22>>»>> =a5t

> page,

BHBHH

»>>>>> Yes we have wood frame too, and no we dont have showroom in USA
=nkBBR =»b3>3> Best Regards

BHBBED

»>»>>> Ombrellificio Adriamare snc

e e e -
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2R

R
>=>2>> <catalogo_adriamare2010.pdf>

S35

el

>>> vear [ NEEEEEEE

o

>>> I'm waiting for shipper's reply about the shipping cost,please be
>>> =atience

>33

>>> Best Regards

=== Antonello Sigismondi

>33

>=> Ombrellificio Adriamare snc

el

-

> Dear Ms [N
-1

> the price for wooden sun bed is € 205,00 each one

-

> the shipping cost to CHARLOTTE AMALIE is € 600,00 + tax and duties
=

= Hoping to hear you soon

-

> Best Regards

= Antonello Sigismondi

= Ombrellificio Adriamare snc

-1
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