From:

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2011 2:16 PM
To: Bradford Jones
Subject: Re: CAD for Epstein

OK, =ut which quote? Can you please resend the quote Marc agreed to? =hanks..

On Sep 21, 2011, at 8:06 AM, Bradford Jones =rote:

If you could just send us a signed =opy of the quote that would be great.

Thanks! =o:p>

Bradford =ones

=ACCO CARPET

New =ork, NY =stl:postalcode =:5t="on">10012

<= glass="MsoNormal">T:=212.226.4344

-

From: |

Sent: Tuesday, September =0, 2011 5:44 PM
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To: Bradford Jones
Subject: Fwd: CAD for =pstein

Hello again.. I'm sorry for all the back and forth, but | had =Iready shown Mr. Epstein your original quote, and
couldn't go back to him to =pprove the new guote without the proper reason as to why it was much higher! To proceed
with this order, do | need to sign anything; the quote, CAD, =tc? Thank you for your help..

Begin forwarded message:

From: :,:"span:Marc Sacco=<Marc@saccocarpet.com></=ont>
Subject: RE: CAD for =pstein
Date: September 20, 2011 2:37:14 PM EDT

Ce: =/span=Bradford Jones=<bradford @saccocarpet.com><=span>

=fspan>

Dear [

Brad has =sked me to review this. The reason is that the price has increased almost 5% =ince June, and we have
passed this small increase on to you, =owever, after reviewing the history of this order, and keeping in mind how
=aluable you are to us as clients, we will hold the old =rice.

<=ul:p>

Best

Marc

<=ul:p>

<=ul:p>

<image001.gif>
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MARC SACCO
Sacco Carpet Corp

www.saccocarpet.com=o:p>

520 BROADWAY

& TH =LOOR

NEW YORK, =st1:state w:st="on">NY 10012
[T]

LF]

[C] </=1:p>
<=ul:p>

From: Bradford lones <=ont size="2" face="Tahoma">
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2011 =:22 PM

To: Marc Sacco

Subject: FW: CAD for =pstein

Bradford =ones

=ACCO CARPET

Mew =ork, NY =stl:postalcode =:5t="on">10012

From: I

Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2011 =1:23 AM
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To: Bradford Jones
Subject: Re: CAD for =pstein

OK, it's not really a discount.. we are just deducting part of a =redit we have with you; we still have payed that
amount of =oney.

It makes sense that you referenced the wrong material at first, =ut still not sure why you are quoting 590 per
square foot for this =ug(which seems extraordinarily high) when we were charged 585 per square foot on the =ast one

with the same design? | would at least expect to pay the same =mount per square foot as we did for the previous rug? |
just need to give Mr. =pstein a plausible reason why this one is going to cost more. Sorry for the back =nd forth.

On Sep 19, 2011, at 3:40 PM, Bradford =ones wrote:

Hi Sarah, I'm sorry | did not =eference the price correctly. In my initial quote | stated the goods were =ull silk
however | did not charge for them, | was quoting another material, accidentally. The last quote is correct. Your cost
however =s only $3240.00 after the discount is applied. Does that clarify? | am =orry for all of the confusion. Please let
me know if this makes =ense.

Thank =ou

Bradford =ones

=ACCO CARPET

New =ork, NY 10012
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From: _
Sent: Monday, September 19, 2011 =:34 PM
To: Bradford Jones

Ce: Kim Steube

Subject: Re: CAD for =pstein

Sorry, but in both quotes, you reference the material as 100% dull silk hand tufted, but =ow it's almost 55,000
more expensive? I'm confused.

On Sep 19, 2011, at 3:01 PM, Bradford =ones || | | GG -t
Hella-

Do not worry about providing a =eposit at this time. We will send a balance proforma when then rug
arrives =ere in NY. As far as the price is concerned you are 100% correct. My =pologies for referencing the wrong
material for this rug. The correct =rice, still reflecting a 75% discount can be found in the attached estimate. =lease
excuse my oversight.

Let us know if you have any =uestions, thanks!

Bradford =ones=o:p=>

=ACCO CARPET

MNew =ork, NY 10012
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rrom: [

Sent: Monday, September 19, 2011 =2:41 PM
To: Bradford =ones

Ce: Kim Steube

Subject: Re: CAD for =pstein

Do | need to fill out the amount of the remaining balance for =he CC form? Or should we wait to pay the
balance once the rug is finished and =he 75% taken from our credit will serve as the deposit for =ow?

The rug should be exactly the same material/ type of rug the =thers are that we ordered for the 3 guest
rooms from you =reviously.

On another note.. I'm curious as to why the price for this rug =s less expensive then the others we
ordered when this one is larger in size? =ou quoted me 58,100 for a 12'x12' rug, and we payed 59,775 for a rug with =he
same design, but 10'x11.5" in size,

On Sep 19, 2011, at 12:30 PM, Bradford =ones wrote:

Hi [

Great we will go ahead and order =his for you today! Please fill out the attached CC form. To confirm
=his entire rug is cut pile correct? We have the agua pom here “cl1” =0 match color to.

Thanks

Bradford =ones=/ns0:personname>

=ACCO CARPET
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<=sl:city=, NY 10012

rror: I

Sent: Monday, September 19, 2011 =2:28 PM
To: Bradford Jones

Cc: Kim Steube

Subject: Re: CAD for =pstein

HI Brad. Rendering looks great. We can go ahead and proceed with =he order for this rug. What do |
need to sign to send back to you to get =his going?

Also, the color in the rendering doesn't look right, but I'm =ure that's a non issue. As long as it's the aqua
color | chose from the tuft samples | sent back to you guys.

Thanks..

On Sep 15, 2011, at 11:22 AM, Bradford =ones<=pan =lass="apple-converted-space"> wrote:

Hello [

Please find the requested CAD for the Epstein Residence. Please let us know if you have any questions.
=hanks!
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Bradford =ones=/ns0:personname>

=ACCO CARPET

<=50:city>, NY=span =lass="apple-converted-space"> 10012

<12 x 12 Silk Sq .jpg>

<CC Form.pdf=

<562 15ks.pdf=

=fo:smarttagtype>
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