
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 15, 2015 9:59 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: Citicar 

Hi Bella, 
Yes, I confirm. 
Thank you, 

> On Dec 15, 2015, at 3:58 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

> Hi 
> Please confirm citicar invoice 

> <Amex_NES_VIP Lotus Citicar 

> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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