
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Friday, June 17, 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: ATT 

Thanks Rich! 

> On Jun 17, 2016, at 12:54 PM, Richard Kahn <  wrote= 

> i will ask when i see him later 
> thanks 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 

» On Jun 17, 2016, at 12:54 PM, Karyna Shuliak w=ote: 

» Hi Bella, 
» I am not sure, you might need to ask JE. All he said was that he wanted h=r to be on his account. 
» Thanks. 

>» On Jun 17, 2016, at 12:27 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

>» Hi Karyna, 
>» In order to add Anna to JE AT&T account and keep her current number she=needs to have a post paid account with 
AT&T. Currently she is on prepaid pl=n $45 a month. When Arina went to At& T store they requested $500 deposit f=om 
her to switch her account to post paid as she doesn't have a social secu=ity number. Please advise should we proceed 
with deposit or reimburse her m=nthly. 
>» 
>» Thank you, 
>» Bella 

>» 
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