
From: 
Sent: Friday, October 7, 2011 1:53 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 2 new rugs we are having made from Sacco Carpet 

Ok thanks. Right, we won't pay for these until they are ready to ship. 

On Oct 7, 2011, at 9:39 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

> i assume i do not have to pay until they are ready after this order 
> our credit balance is $61,944 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
> New York, NY 10065 

> On Oct 6, 2011, at 11:56 AM, wrote: 

» <$6215ks.pdf><$6267ks.pdf> 
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