From: Richard kahn < -

Sent: Thursday, November 12, 2015 910 PM
To: Karyna Shuliak
Subject: Fwd: | Spoke to Ms. Hendricks...

please bring an extra check or two with you on this trip so =ou can make this payment and any others that may be
needed thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/b>Cecile de Jongh </ G-
Subject: =/b>| Spoke to Ms. =endricks...

Date: November 12, 2015 at 3:48:54 PM EST

To: =/b>Karyna Shuliak -:_::-
Cc: Richard Kahn f_:, leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Reply-To: =/b>Cecile de Jongh {—::-

...and she said that the annual premium is 51,254 from =ctober 1, 2015 to September 30, 2016 re the mal
practice =nsurance. They will prorate the premium so they need a check for =1,149.50 for your insurance which will run
from November 1, 2015 to =eptember 30, 2016. She was supposed to email me the forms for you =o fill out but has not
done so as yet and I've called her back several =imes to remind her. The cap on the insurance is $250,000, which =s
what is required for the VI. If you want more, you can always =et supplemental coverage with a private insurer.
Perhaps =ou can keep calling her as well @

With warm =egards,

Cecile
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