From: bellaklein >

Sent: Thursday, March 10, 2016 6:38 PM
To: Karyna Shuliak

Subject: Re: JE Amex charged

thanks

Thank you,

Bella

On Mar 10, 2016, at 1:29 PM, Karyna Shuliak <{|| | NN wrote:

Hi Bella,
It is for LSJ.
Thanks!

On Mar 10, 2016, =t 12:46 PM, bellaklein _> > wrote:

Hi Karyna,
Please confirm =hat the attached purchases made for LS) or PB,

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: JE Amex charged

Date: March 9, 2016 at 11:23:42 PM EST

To: Bella Klein < >
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=ou have guestions,

Hi Bella,

Here are the receipts =or the charges made with JE Amex for the past this Wednesday in case

Thanks,

Karyna.
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