
From: Sarah K 
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2011 3:49 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: 

Ok great. Thank you! 

On Oct 24, 2011, at 11:48 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> gave him $1,000 for 71st and reimbursed $240 for 14G txs On Oct 24, 
> 2011, at 11:31 AM, Sarah K wrote: 

» they have some receipts for reimbursement from my apt, but they need 
» more=cash now to go buy supplies for 71st. I'm sure they will submit 
» receipts af=er they purchase the items 

» On Oct 24, 2011, at 11:19 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

>» Will they have receipts? 
>» On Oct 24, 2011, at 11:19 AM, Sarah K wrote: 
>>> 

»» Ion and Michael are going to come see you to get some petty cash for ma=erials for work they are doing at 71st. 
>» 

<?xml version=.0" encoding=TF-8"?> 
<!DOCTYPE plist PUBLIC "-//Apple//DTD PLIST 1.0//EN" "http://www.apple.com/DTDs/Propertylist-1.0.dtd"> 
<plist version=.0"> 
<dict> 

<key>date-sent</key> 
<real>1319471360</real> 
<key>flags</key> 
<integer>8590195713</integer> 
<key>original-mailbox<Aey> 
<string>imap:// 
<key>remote-id</key> 
<string>6782</string> 
<key>subject</key> 
<string>Re:</string> 

</dict> 
</plist> 

nt%20Messages</string> 

EFTA_R1_01262038 
EFTA02330403


