
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, August 26, 2015 2:20 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Paris/Working on St. Barth's hotel 

The flights are reserved only. Not purchased. But the reservations will exp=re prior to Aug 31. Is that ok? Trying to find 
out if the hotel is St Bart=s will provide a letter with just the reservation. They want us to pay up f=ont. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Aug 26, 2015, at 9:52 AM, Karyna Shuliak wro=e: 

> Hi 
> As it says in the note, you can just book the flights, you don't have to p=rchase. This is all for the visa, I will not use 
them. Departure to Paris o= the 9th is absolutely fine too, as long as the arrival is on 10th. 
> Thank you! 

» On Aug 26, 2015, at 7:39 AM, wrote: 

» Hi Karyna...FYI-there are no day flights to Paris on Sept. 10th*=A6you must depart on Sept 9th to arrive on the 
10th...woking on the a=tual hotel confirmation today as the reservation department was already clo=ed yesterday....The 
flight is fully refundable. Hotel must be cancel=ed 1 day prior to arrival. 

» ...still working on the hotel for St. Barth's!...all o= the Amex Centurian properties are sold out for your dates...will 
se=rch other hotel options 

» ...the flights to/from St. Barth's are ALL non refundable*=80*I remember this from last year now...we have 
reserved the flight=for you to St. Barth's...it is $1188.72...maybe you onl= need the reservation and we don't actually 
purchase? Please let m= know... 
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