
From: 
Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2011 6:54 PM 
To: Witt, Judy 
Subject: Re: SLK Designs 

Thank you Judy. I faxed over my credit card details last night. I just =ant to confirm they were received. Also, is it possible 
to get a =reakdown and confirmation of my order from you with prices for each =iece, etc, so I know my order is exactly 
as it should be? 

a thanks, 
On Nov 9, 2011, at 11:47 AM, Witt, Judy wrote: 

> I attached a new letter with corrected e-mail. 

> Judy Witt 
> Senior Claims Specialist 
> FurnitureBrands 

 Original Message 
> From: Witt, Judy 
> Sent: Wednesday, November 09, 2011 10:44 AM 
> To: -
> Subject: RE: SLK Designs 

> Attached is the CWO letter with the amount that is due and attached =s Ach or Credit Card forms for payment. 

> Thank You, 

> Judy Witt 
> Senior Claims Specialist 
> FurnitureBrands 

 Original Message 
> Fro 
> Sent: Wednesday, November 09, 2011 10:39 AM 
> To: Witt, Judy 
> Subject: SLK Designs 
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> Hi Judy, 
> This is 
received this OK. =hanks! 
> Best, 

from SLK Designs. I just received your =oicemail. Here is my email if you can confirm you 

> <ACH name.pdf><LaneVenture cc with name.pdf><SLK Designs.doc> 
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