
From: Daphne Wallace 
Sent: Monday, November 3, 2014 7:14 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Janusz Banasiak 
Subject: Re: White desk chairs 

Greetings Karyna, 

We need it for Custom= purposes. I am reaching out to Bella - if we can figure out what ve=dor, we can probably call for 
a copy. 

If this doe= not work - we will create an invoice of our own. Janusz, can you em=il me a photo of the label that came on 
the box - it hopefully has the pro=er name of the vendor, DW 

<=iv class="gmail_extra"> 

On Mon, Nov 3, 201= at 2:09 PM, Karyna Shuliak 
wrote: 

Is there=any way to ship it without the invoice then? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 3, 2014, at 3:00 PM, Janusz Banas=ak > wrote: 

They are =ot there 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 3, 2014, at 1:51 =M, Karyna Shuliak 
<mailto > wrote: 

The chairs have been ordered by Mr. Epstein and h= does not have an invoice, but there should be an 
invoice in the box when =ou open. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 3, 2014, at 11:56=AM, Janusz Banasiak 
wrote: 

Yes will need an invoice thanks Daphne 
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Sent from my iPhonec/=iv> 

On Nov 3, 2014, at 10:43 AM, Daphne Wallace 4:: > wr=te: 

Greeti ngs=Karyna, 

Do you have a copy of the invoice? 

Kind regards, OW 
<=1" 

Mon, Nov 3, 2014 at 10:42 AM, Karyna Shuli=k 
<mailto > wrote: 

Hi Janusz, 
As per Mr. Epstein's request, please ship the boxes with white desk cha=rs from 

Palm Beach to LSJ. 
Thank you, 
Karyna. 

Sent from my iPhone 
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