
From: 
Sent: Friday, November 11, 2011 3:35 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Ion 

He did mention he still had receipts for you. JE had him fly to the =sland last minute last week and he is still there, so he 
hasn't had a =hance to submit them to you yet. I'm sure he will do so once he's back =n NY 

On Nov 11, 2011, at 10:32 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> Hi Sarah, 
> Ion took $1000 back in October for painting supplies for your apt and =1st office. Did he submit receipts to you? 
Should I request it from =im? 
> Thx, 
> Bella 
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