To:
From: Msg Sheet)

Sent: Thur 4/8/2004 8:27:06 PM
Subject: Gmax Msg

From: Helen Taken by: HELEN con 04/08/2004
FPhone#

Bonnie Benedek will check again the cost of
back to me today, but it will depend on whether she can get ahold of the

manufacturer.

the custom carpet. She'll try to get

** End of Messag
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