
To: 
From: sg 
Sent: Wed 4/28/2004 3:57:58 PM 
Subject: Gmax Msg 

From: Eric Taken by: ERIC GANY on 04/28/2004 
Phone, 

The ice shield at the microwave tower at Zorro was damage by an ice storm and 
needs to be repaired. The repair estimate is $1,200. Please approve. 

** End of Messag 
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