
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, August 19, 2014 10:55 AM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: Regarding the LSJE Sport's - August 5, 2014 

Sent from my iPhone 
=br>Begin forwarded message: 

=rom: "Adam Zygowski " 
Date: August 19, 2014 at 6:10:05 AM ED= 
To: "Richard Kahn" < <mailto 
Cc: "Daphne Wallace" < 
Subject:=/b> Re: Regarding the LSJE Sportis - August 5, 2014 

=>> > 

Rich, as mentioned several ti=es - if the boat was sent with engines we would already have the testing 
do=e. 

Otherwise we must use engines from other project, not wa=ting to spend over USD 60 k for new 
Yamaha engines. 

=br>Best regards 
Adam Zygowski 
=br> 

Dnia 18-08-2014 o 12:46:18 Richa=d Kahn 
<mailto >  napisal(a): 

Adam we have been very patient. First we received a boat th=t the surveyors said was below 
par and not safe. Then we s=nt the boat back to Poland only to be told that you have no engines to test=the boat . 
Now you write that you have found one engine only an= we almost 9 months after completion, have no boat from you. 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
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New York, NY 10022 

On Aug 18, 2014, at 6:37 AM, "Adam Zygowski &nb=p;" 
<mailto > w=ote: 

We have received one engine, the s=cond one (counter rotation) will be with us on 
Wednesday this wee 

Adam Zygowski 

please advi=e if engines have arrived 

=blockquote type="cite"> 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 
=/blockquote> 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Fl=or 

New York, NY 10=22 
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<=lockquote type="cite"> 

n> 

<=blockquote> 

On Aug 8, 2014, at 8:28 AM, Adam Zygowski < 
<mailto > wrote: 

=/blockquote> 

follows: 

hopefully 20-22 August 

Hi, 

Following our=phone discussion dd. 5th August, I would like to inform you as 

=blockquote type="cite"> 

2. The engines will arrive to us next week= 

3. Afterwards we need to mount the installation and the=test date would be 
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</=lockquote> 

=blockquote type="cite> 

Adam Zygowski 

=/blockquote> 

Dnia 05-08-2014 o=15:15:57 Daphne Wallace 
<mailto » napisat(a): 

<=blockquote> 

Greetings Adam, 

Kind regards, Daphne 

=blockquote type="cite"> 

clockquote type="cite"> 
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SPORTIS S.A. 

www.sportis.com.pl 

aspan> 

http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385 
<http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/15118927=950385> 

http://twitter.com/K=/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/In/sportis_sa> 

https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394 
<https://plus.google.com/1091=4365046263030394> <=r> 

Regon 191726929, NIP 

<=1> 

SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Polan= 
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<=blockquote> 

mob. +=48 697 250 500 

http://twitter.com=#!/sportis_sa <http://twitter.comfirl/sportis_sa> 

https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394 
<https://plus.google.com/1091=4365046263030394> cr> 

Rejestracja: Sad Rejonowy Gdarisk=Polnoc Oddziaf w Gdarisku, 

VIII Wydzia=C5 Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapitaf zakf=dowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloSci optacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 

clockquote type="cite"> 

=egistered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdarisk-Potnoc in G=arisk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: &nb=p;PL 5881840279 

=blockquote type="cite"> 
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ar>SPORTIS S.A. 
84-207 Koleczkowo 
ul. N= 0ambnik 22, Bojano Poland 

/span> 

/span> 
<=a> <mailto 

www.sportis.com.pl=/a> <http://www.sportis.com.pl> 

http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/1511892749=0385 
<http://www.facebook.com/pag=s/SPORTIS/151189274950385> 

http:=/twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa> 
https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394<=a> 

<https://plus.googre.com/109174365046263030394> 

Rejestracja: Sad Rejonowy Gda4)=84sk Pritnoc Oddzial w Gdarisku, 
VIII Wyd=ial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 
kapital zak*=82adowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloSci oplacony. 
<=pan>Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Reg=stered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdarisk-Polnoc in 
Gda=C540sk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: P= 5881840279 
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