
From: ZM 
Sent: Tuesday, May 30, 2017 8:38 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: ZM Log Cabin 

Would it be ok to get a stand behind roller for a couple of days $500.00 ? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 30, 2017, at 9:42 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

No 

On Tue, May 30, 2017 at 11:40 AM ZM <z > wrote: 

Jeffrey 
The cows got past Hotwire at the log cabin and badly damaged the tuff in the front of the cabin 
Generally we would fill in holes and reseed, but with up coming Ceremony there is no time for this area 

to recover. 
Therefore I would propose we sod the area. This could be completed by tomorrow night, giving it time 

to settle for Saturdays ceremony . 
Cost $2300.00 
This also includes a small area at the entrance to Larrys house where the hydro seed did not take 
Can we proceed 
Regards Brice 

Sent from my iPhone 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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