
From: Brad Wechsler 
Sent: Sunday, April 26, 2015 8:22 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com* 
Subject: Re: 

Now? 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Sunday, April 26, 2015 04:09 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Re: 

four trusts. . longer dicsucccin . 

On Sun, Apr 26, 2015 at 2:44 PM, Brad Wechsler > wrote: 

Jeffrey-heather will send. Any chance you spoke to leon abt dante. I assume if we have the 4 trusts buy we need 
to set up a spy owned by all 4. Alternatives are to propose to trustees of apol or 2 or personal purchase. Thgts? 

(Rich will get u phaidon operating data though RA presents some challenges.) 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Sunday, April 26, 2015 12:33 PM 
To: Heather Gra ; Brad Wechsler; Melanie Spinella 

Subject: 

heather can you send me the picasso sculpture draft contract. I think it better if a leon a on behalf of himself 
and an assignable entity merely bought the piecee from gogosian gallery , on thesame payment terms plus sales tax. 
let Larry earn his money, his office can organize insureance transport etc. a simple purchase from gogosian prevents 
many tricky issues 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

www.imax.com <http://www.imax.com> 
'MAX' is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended 

only for the use of the individual or entity named above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any 

dissemination, distribution, copying 
or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail was not addressed 

to you , please immediately notify us 
by phone in Canada at (905) 403-6500 <tel:%28905%29%20403-6500> (collect calls will be accepted) or by 

email at webmaster@imax.com <mailto:webmaster@imax.com> and delete and destroy this 
correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

www.imax.com 
'MAX. is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended only for 
the use of the individual or entity named above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution, copying or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If 
this e-mail was not addressed to you , please immediately notify us by phone in Canada at (905) 403-6500 (collect calls 
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will be accepted) or by email at webmaster@imax.com and delete and destroy this correspondence inadvertently sent 
to you. Thank you 
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