
From: Ann Rodriquez aMil 
Sent: Thursday, September 1, 2016 5:50 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Brice Gordon: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Great Wall of LS) 

Hey Bossman, 

Mr. Malbranche is requesting $7,000.00 to pay his guys tomorrow afternoon? = 146ft incomplete/274ft completed 

Paid to date: $13,500.00 
Bid: $35,000.00 
Owed: $21,500.00 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

> On Aug 22, 2016, at 5:20 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

> 150/420 pay him 3k total owed 12 .5 . 

» On Mon, Aug 22, 2016 at 5:05 PM, Ann Rodriquez < w=ote: 
» Hey Bossman, 

» I only gave him $2k on Friday instead of 10k just in case you weren't sat=sfied. Would you like toN1>+HV1m?1!8) k{% 
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