
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2015 2:44 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: JEE loan 

I will have Darren draft settlement le=ter and release of liens. 

Sent from my iPhone 

B=gin forwarded message: 

From:=/b> Vera Savcic < 
Date: July 10, 2015 at 9:29:45 AM EDT 
To= Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Adam Bly < 
Subject: Re: JEE loan 
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> > 

Yes, this is acceptable. We=will pay $170k as full and final settlement. 
We need to draf= a settlement letter and outline the release of any liens against Adam etc.=before 

releasing the funds. 
Shall I work with your att=rney on this today? 
Vera 

On J=19, 2015, at 12:00 PM, Richard Kahn < 

<nlailtc » wrote: 

thanks for your email 
as a courtesy jeffrey would=accept 170,000 if paid in full 
if that is not acceptab=e you can continue making your monthly payments at 18% 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associ=tes Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
Ne= York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 
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