
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, December 17, 2014 5:17 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Dylan finally needs braces! 

Should I call Rich about it? The one time payment is $6080.0O. I can take a picture of the bill or send it to him. 

On Dec 16, 2014, at 11:22 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

One time 

On Tuesday, December 16, 2014, Sophie < <mailto 
wrote: 

> > 

Dear man, Dylan had her appointment today and they said the time has finally come. Please let me 
know either when a good time to speak is or how you want me to proceed. They allow for a one time payment or 
monthly payments for alittle bit more. 

I am so grateful to you, S 

Sent from my iPad. 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_01304616 
EFTA02340215


