From: Ann Rodriquez

Subject: Fwd: Pokey: LSJ Thatching

Sent: Friday, July 29, 2016 3:25:50 PM
To: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

Pokey and Oscal has finished all the Thatching on LSJ. Can | pay him the balance of $2,000.00?

Please advise,
Ann R,

Begin forwarded message:
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail com>
Date: July 22, 2016 at 8:45:50 AM AST
To: Ann Rodriquez
Subject: Re: Pokey: LSJ Thatching

yes

On Fri, Jul 22, 2016 at 8:45 AM, Ann Rodrique T ot

He's going to start right now. should we give him $1,000 now and then $2,000.00
once it's 100% completed?

Please advise,
Ann R,

On Jul 22, 2016, at 8:42 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail. com=> wrote:

ok then 3k

On Fri, Jul 22, 2016 at 8:41 AM, Ann Rodriquez | | KT

WTOLE:

He said no more than 2weeks
Ann R,

On Jul 22, 2016, at 8:38 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail com> wrote:

how long will it take?
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On Fri, Jul 22, 2016 at 8:37 AM, Ann Rodrigquez
ﬁwrme:

Hey Bossman,
Pokey 1s asking for $3,500.00 to do the thatching on LS5J?

Need thatching:
Main Shed

New Beach

St. John Lookout
Tiki hut

Please advise,
Ann R,
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
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including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved
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