
From: 
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2015 10:46 AM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: masterclass 

Richard should already have all the details - the =nes I sent you last week. 

Original Message 

From: jeffrey E. 
Sent: 13 Jul 2015 10:45:04 GMT 
To: 
Subject: Re: masterclass 

wire to where? 

On Mon, Jul 13, 2015 at 6:23 AM, 
<mailto > wrote: 

> 

This morning I contacted the administration for masterclas= and asked if it was okay to pay participation fee 
now, together with th= application fee and accommodation. In this case instead of doing two wire=transfers - one now 
and other in beginning of August - there was only one transfer, which I believe would safe mone= and time. 

They approved that it's ok to send all amount at once. It would be: 
Application fee - 80 euro 
Accommodation - 363 euro (11days) 
Participation fee - 300 euro 

Total of 743,-Euro 

p=ease note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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