
From: Alireza Ittihadieh < 
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2017 2:50 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: G550-5395 

Do you want to show him 5298 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
Tel: 

From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent: Wednesday, 5 April 2017 22:46 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: G550-5395 

not my problem its his 

On Wed, Apr 5, 2017 at 2:51 PM, Alireza Ittihadi=h < 
<mailto > wrote: 

It is under LOI with a $5M deposit. 

It's a pity, it was a beautiful Aircraft. 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
Tel: <tel 

please note 
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