From: Kathy Ruemmier <IN -

Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2015 11:19 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

Home now. NN

Se=t from my iPad

On Jul 22, 2015, at 6:53 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:<=r>

shots?

On Wed, Jul 22, 2=15 at 6:37 PV, <[ I - > ot

The girls very much want m= to go to Africa. What do you think?
Sent from my iPhon=

On Jul 22, 2015, at 6:17 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wro=e;

i went thro=gh with ariane . fee issues. complicated.&nbs=; no free cash. what do you think of the
following.=nbsp; ariane pays southern trust { my co ). b=sed on final settlement with DOJ., payment between 150-
20=-- 5 million, 100-150. 10 million ,=nbsp; under 100 25 million. . doyou see any legal issues=?

=nbsp; please note

The information contained in th=s communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may<=r=constitute inside information, and is intended
only for

the use of the=addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or c=pying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, an=

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all att=chments. copyright -all rights reserved
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