
From: Erika Kellerhals 
Sent: Thursday, February 11, 2016 11:12 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Ann Rodriquez; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: GS): Mat Kieffer 

Nope $5,000 + expenses. We have right to terminate at any time. So we can terminate whenever and just pay him. Let 
me know what you would like me to do. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 11, 2016, at 2:45 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

he was to get paid 7500 for the month? right , lets make sure it happens and then he is gone 

On Thu, Feb 11, 2016 at 5:36 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
<mailto:annrodriquez@yahoo.com» wrote: 

I just received this message from Mat? 

Ann R. 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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