
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

brice gordon 
Monday, February 27, 2017 2:28 PM 
jeffrey E. 
Richard Kahn 
Re: LSJ HP Pump Replacement Rev1 

thank you 

Rich, I will separate out att=ched invoices, and forward with wiring instructions 

On Mon, Feb 27, 2017 at 10:=9 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> wrote: 

ok 

On Sun, Feb 2=, 2017 at 7:44 AM, brice gordon 

Jeffrey 

>=wrote: 

=/div> 
attached are quotes for the replacement the HP Pump, Spare =arts and Pre Filter for the LSJ RO Plant 
E-Mail of Recommendatio= from Patrick Adams TSG 
Previous report E Mailed to you Feb 17th4div> 
Comparison of Cost Report 
TSG proposal for Danfoss Pum= 

Replacement of the HP Pump, Spare Parts and Ship=ing $ 45,959.70 USD 
(Lead Time 4-6 Weeks to Tropical=FI) 
Pre Filter =C2 =A0 =C2 $ 4,707.46 

Protec Membran= Parts 
PLC Reprogram =C2 
Installation 

Estimated total =A0 

=A0 
=A0 

=A0 

$= 2526.80 
$=1500.00 (Verbal) 

=C2 $ 6000.00 (estimated) 

=C2 =AO $60,693.96 

=he E Mail from Patrick, in broad strokes explains the recommendation to go=with this pump. 
The plan is to get Patrick to LSJ Mid March, to =o critical membrane service, training and then back again to do 

pump insta=l. 
LS1 personal will be required to assist. 
We need to=do a Membrane service to relieve the high pressure situation on the existi=g HP Pump and also 

calibration of the post water treatment systems. 
<=iv>The order of Protec parts are critical if you wish to still make wat=r, and hopefully extend the life to the 

Existing HP Pump 

One other issue that needs to be addressed is the Control Panel=that was Saturated with Sea Water in 2014. 

EFTA_R1_01313044 
EFTA02344179



Patrick will re=iew this whilst on sight, and forward recommendations. 

Can we proceed with purchasing? 

=div>Brice Gordon 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is confidential, =ay be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside 
information, an= is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of.IEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or 
copying of this communication o= any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you ha=e received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by=br>return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communicat=on and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
copyright -all ri=hts reserved 

Brice Gordon 
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