
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Monday, May 18, 2015 6:38 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: Final Invoice 
Attachments: image001.jpg; Untitled attachment 00007.htm; image010jpg; Untitled attachment 

00010.htm; image012jpg; Untitled attachment 00013.htm; JEGE,LLC Invoice.pdf; 
Untitled attachment 00016.htm; #13127 Final INvoice Oct 14.pdf, Untitled attachment 
00019.htm 

two invoices were attached 
old invoice dated =ct 2013 shows the carry forward balance of 20,340 to sep 2014 invoice =hich has disputed amount 
total of 76,230 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Richard Kahn .4 :> 

Subject: =/b>Fwd: Final =nvoice 

Date: =/b>May 18, 2015 at 1:41:45 PM =DT 

To: =/b>Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Sent from my =Phone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Date: March 18, 2015 at 10:05:18 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn oichardkahn12@gmail,com> 
Subject: Fwd: Final Invoice 
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Sent from my iPhone 

Begin =orwarded message: 

From: Larry =isoski > 
Date: =eptember 24, 2014 at 10:57:58 AM MDT 
To: =ich Kahn < 
Subject: Fwd: Final Invoice 

One more email to =ollow 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eric Roth c » 
Date:=September 22, 2014 at 3:11:45 PM EDT 

To: =vjet sr > > 
Subject: =b class="">RE: Final Invoice 

Attached are the invoices. 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

> > 
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