From: Cecile de Jongh |

Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2015 9:10 PM
To: Daphne Wallace

Cc: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re:

Hi Jeffrey,

John Woods called me a fe= weeks after he sent the letter to you. He wanted to know if the deci=ion not to pay the
invoice was final and | told him yes, based on what Daph=e relayed to me. He said okay and thanked me for letting him
know.

With warm regards,

Cecile

<=iv>Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone.

On Dec 1, 2015, at 4:40 PM, Daphne Wallace {1 . rote:

Greetings Mr. Epstein,

John Woods was left wit= a open invoice of 58,000 (INV. 15-001.4 dated 9/22/15), and a pending invo=ce of 54,500 to
fulfill the contract of $70,000.

H=s circumstance was not good - he really was in need of the money to make pa=roll and pay consultants that he had to
hire to address the HVAC and other r=quirements for the projects.

He was not happy that=he did not receive payment, and he disagreed with the explanation, which he=expressed in the
letter he wrote on 10/23/15, but he did not indicate to me=or threaten to me to ask people not to work for you or the

company. </=iv>

Respectfully, Daphne

On Tue, Dec 1, 2015 at 3:20 PM, je=frey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

=div dir="Itr">how did we leave it with john woods, what is hi= circumstance. is he asking people not to work

&=bsp; please note

The information contained in this communication is=br>confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute insid= information, and is intended only for
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the use of the addressee. It is t=e property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

=ommunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlaw=ul. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation=gmail.com> , and
destroy this=scommunication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyrig=t -all rights reserved
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