
From: Kathy Ruemmler 
Sent: Tuesday, December 15, 2015 11:29 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

SOF is now final. I am pushing Dal to close by Friday. 

Sent from my iPad 

On Dec 15, 2015, at 6:17 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

good work 

On Tue, Dec 15, 2015 at 6:01 PM, Kathy Ruemmler <kathyruemmler@gmail.com 
<mailto:kathyruemmler@gmail.com» wrote: 

Credit Agricole will pay $99 mm. They had roughly the same number of US accounts and a lower AUM 
($1.8 b, compared to our $2.16 b). This is the comparison that matters. 

Sent from my iPad 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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