From:

Sent: Saturday, August 13, 2016 9:11 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: Budget - Levitection

Hi Jeff

Mo need to be sorry.

| under=tand and accept.

Let's keep searc=ing the horizon
for better ones.&=bsp;

Best

EB

Sent from my iPhone
<=jy>
On 13 Aug 2016, at 21:49, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacati=n@gmail.com> > wrote:

| have reviewed in detail. &nbs=; the numbersareodd. ? more importan=ly micha goldman is not an
unknown entity , udi, seeing his name clea=ly defined on the budget, but " not knowing who it was, o= what the
business of the person was or telling me that he coul=nt even remember his last name, gets added to the fact that he
t=ld me goldman fee was 70k not 75, his, udis' 408&nb=p; not 45. contingencys on the budget with a f=ot note that
they WILL be used. ? if so, they are not co=tingencies. ? ! already budgeted bonuses paid tof=unders. 7 allin
&n=sp; | must decline to move further with this investment.

as you , | feel no emotion about investments, | cherish o=r friendship. . | have a very strong discipline about
fol=owing my investment instinct. SORRY .

Hi Jeff

Please have a look.Sorry for the delay. Let=s talk tomorrow.
Best

EB

Sent from my iPho=e
Begin forwarded message:

From: Udi Knaani 3

Date: 9 August 2016 at=11:24:09 GMT+3
To: "Ehud Barak

Cc: Inb=l 5ustiel
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Subject: FW: Budget - Levitection=br=>
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