From: Richard Kahn <

Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2016 4:52 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: PRD cushion replacement

just spoke with anna and found out that Brice gave Evelyn =pproval and she began work and is already 50% complete
seems reckless that he had her begin work without a formal =uote which was only received yesterday at my request

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Dec 6, 2016, at 10:57 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

Order =s a common boat

On Tue, Dec 6, 2016 at 11:54 AM Richard Kahn _ wrote:

not sure on =easurements as it may be custom sizing?
will =heck with carlos..

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates =nc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel =
fax
cell
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On Dec 6, 2016, at 10:17 =M, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > =rote:

Can we buy in the store

On Tue, Dec 6, 2016 at 11:08 AM Richard Kahn _> wrote:

estimate received by carlos is for 4,700.00
please advise if ok to proceed
thank you

Richard=Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel -

fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Fwd:=Please forward to Daphne or Una ASAP

ro:=rich <

Hi Rich,

As per your request, = am forwarding to you a revised quote from Evelyne of
Custom =anvas. As per Brice instructions to Carlos, he wants all the =ushion
replace on PRD.
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Thanks,
Una

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Daphne Wallace _
Date: Tue, Dec 6, 2016 at 9:52 AM

Subject: Fwd: Please forward to Daphne or Una =SAP

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: "Carlos Rodriguez" <[

Date: =ec 6, 2016 9:49 AM
Subject: Fwd: Please forward =o Daphne or Una ASAP

To: "Daphne Wallace" _ "Ann Rodriquez"

Cc:

Sent from my =Phone

Begin =orwarded message:

From: Custom Canvas <customcanvas42@yahoo.com>

Date: December 6, 2016 at =:18:38 AM AST

To: =arlos Rodriguez

Subject: Please forward to Daphne or Una ASAP

Reply-To: Custom Canvas =lt;customcanvasd42@yahoo.com
<mailto:customcanvasd42 @yahoo.com> >

Requested work to be done for LS) Boat:;
Five new boat cushions as per original design, new =oam, new upholstery
Sunbrella slip covers for the above cushions

Two long side bolsters to be reupholstered
All cushions: Using Royal Blue SeaQuest Marine Vinyl =s specified

Total Estimated cost for all the above: =4,700.00
Required deposit; $2350.00

Mote: This is an estimate, not a quote or fixed =rice.
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Unforeseen difficulties and/or unknown requests may =arrant additional labor

and/or materials

Please let us know As Soon As Possible whether or =ot a check is being

generated for this work.

We are in the process =f ordering materials and would like to include your order

with the =thers.

Thank you !

Regards,

Christian =nd Evelyne Nye
Custom Canvas & Sails, Inc.
65193 =state Frydenhoj 42

St. Thomas, USVI, 00802-1402

o e /fax

customcanvasd2 @yahoo.com
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