From: Nadia [

Sent: Monday, April 20, 2015 6:23 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: 2

Thank you.

Sent from my i=hone

On Apr 20, 2015, at 5:50 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

yes

-

| went over=tax prep documents last week and it looks like the total for last May-Dec i= around 50k and
18k so far this Jan-March. Can | count on the double?=nbsp;

Nadia

Sent from my iPhone

=  please note

The infarmation co=tained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client pri=ileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
t=e use of the addressee, It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, d=sclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictl= prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communicat=on in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail t= jeevacation@gmas=l.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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