From: Brice Gordon | GGG

Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2017 1:19 AM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: ZM Mercedes 5500

Jef=rey

=div class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small">Mercedes of ABQ are =aving difficulty obtaining Transmission module

options are:
1. OEM Part Germany,- Back Order, $953.70, unable=to confirm delivery
2. Remanufactured Part from CA, 51683.=0, 3 days

how do you wish to proceed,

regards Brice

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 10:=1 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com= > wrote:

Ok

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 12:23 PM Brice Gordon _

Jeffrey
attached Video and Repair estimate for your reference =/div>

During the final inspect=on of the Mercedes 5 500, the Technician discovered found oil and water co=tamination
in the Transmission control unit.This is due to failed Electron=c connector at the Transmission

The cost to repair will be an additional 51447 879

Total Cost of repairs, as of date, including the a=ove, less tax 58297.87
D= you wish to proceed with repair?

regards

Brice Gordon
Stanl=y, NM
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=C24) please note

The information contained in this co=munication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including =l attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

Brice Gordon
Stanley, NI
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