From: Larry ‘u’isoski_

Sent: Monday, April 13, 2015 1:48 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Marrakesh

That helps, thank you,
What date for arrival into Marrakesh ?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 13, 2015, at 9:46 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Paris . . me mr mrs Lang

On Monday, April 13, 2015, Larry ‘u’isuSki_'n <mai|tc:|_ wrote:

Jeffrey

In order to obtain Landing permission for Marrakesh, | need to list departure airport and passenger
manifest.,
Do you think our departure airport is 5t Thomas on Saturday in Boeing?

Estimated cost for landing permission request 51,800

I will have Maintenace update on Boeing later this afternoon, Larry Morrison indicates we may have
time to complete Flap AD inspection to check for cracks by Friday, baring no cracks should not pose issue,.

- we sent out Two Main wheel assemblies for new tires installed due to dry rot and cracking on rubber,

-Replacing PCU actuator for elevator control due to leak, should have exchange unit later this week,

When your able to share possible schedule and which aircraft, I'd appreciate it, so | can arrange Boeing
pilots?

Bill Hammond mentioned he is busy opening a new shoe store that he owns with his brother, but is
interested in flying this trip,.

Thank you
Larry

Sent from my iPhone
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please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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