
From: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Sent: Tuesday, January 1111111 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: RE: Fw: BBJ 

What are your other choices here? 

I think the correct thing to do is to split the Differece as you were always prepared to spend up to $6/7M for your 
interior. 

You have a Negotiated agreement, sign it put up a HARD Deposit and get the Job Done. 

Thanks 

BR 
Alireza 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Tuesday, January 27, 2015 11:52 AM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: Fw: BBJ 

i appriectate your effort. as yours in number 6 , though low hours. the renovation is expensive , very very time 
consuming and frankly your plane is unsaleable. you and I both know it. there are almost no real buyers out there. . 
your bbj and my 727 are dinosaurs. . no easy answers to either 

On Tue, Jan 27, 2015 at 7:45 AM, Alireza Ittihadieh 
wrote: 

I'm afraid that the Seller ccan'be responsiblet for your extensive rearrangement of the Aircraft Cabin. 

I think you're getting a fair deal as you're not flexible with keeping parts of the cabin. 
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If you're not interested, I will stop the process with JetAviation. 

As Ever 

V-BR 

Alireza ITTIHADIEH 

 Original message 

From: Jeffrey E. 

Date: Tue, Jan 27, 2015 12:13 

To: Alireza Ittihadieh; 

Subject:Re: Fw: BBJ 

thanks, does this mean you will sell the bbj at 21. . as i am all in for 30 as you know. 

On Mon, Jan 26, 2015 at 5:32 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh 
wrote: 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 

From: Alireza Ittihadieh 

Sent: Monday, 26 January 2015 14:03 

To: JEFF EPSTEIN 

Subject: BBJ 

Hi Jeff, 
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Jet Aviation US in st Louis has now advided that they can do your floor plan and CMS for $9M 

Does this interest you? 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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